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North Tyneside Council

Freedom of Information Request FOI1728

Request:

We are researching the costs to your organisation for completing chewing gum removal, we have 5 simple questions.

*If you do not hold separate analytics for gum removal alone, please report on street deep cleaning/cleansing/power
washing (not sweeping).

—_

What primary method of removal do you use for *chewing gum removal:

High pressure water lancing
Chemicals/solvents

High pressure steam

Other (please state)

M o0

What was the cost of *chewing gum removal (whether carried out in house or contracted out) in:

20157
20167

oo

3. Do you contract out your *chewing gum removal services or is us completed all in house?
4. If outsourced, what is the renewal date of the cleaning contract?
5. Please supply the name and contact details for the department responsible for managing this contract.

Submitted on 16/09/19.

Response:

We are researching the costs to your organisation for completing chewing gum removal, we have 5 simple questions.

If you do not hold separate analytics for gum removal alone, please report on street deep
cleaning/cleansing/power washing (not sweeping).

Any chewing gum removal would take place as part of our sweeping schedules, there is no separate chewing gum
removal service.

*1. What primary method of removal do you use for chewing gum removal:
a. High pressure water lancing

No

b. Chemicals/solvents

No

c. High pressure steam

No

d. Other (please state)

The information supplied to you is owned by the council unless otherwise stated and may be protected by copyright. You
are free to use it for your own purposes, including any non-commercial research or for the purposes of news reporting. Any
other re-use of a commercial nature will require the permission of North Tyneside Council. Further enquiries in this respect
should be directed to Information Governance Team, North Tyneside Council, Quadrant, The Silver Link North, Cobalt
Business Park, North Tyneside, NE27 OBY.
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No

*2. What was the cost of chewing gum removal (whether carried out in house or contracted out) in:
a.2015?

N/a

b.20167?

N/a

*3. Do you contract out your chewing gum removal services or is us completed all in house?

N/A

4. If outsourced, what is the renewal date of the cleaning contract?

n/a

5. Please supply the name and contact details for the department responsible for managing this contract.

n/a

The information supplied to you is owned by the council unless otherwise stated and may be protected by copyright. You
are free to use it for your own purposes, including any non-commercial research or for the purposes of news reporting. Any
other re-use of a commercial nature will require the permission of North Tyneside Council. Further enquiries in this respect
should be directed to Information Governance Team, North Tyneside Council, Quadrant, The Silver Link North, Cobalt
Business Park, North Tyneside, NE27 OBY.
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