
Request:
1 please can you let me know how much was spent on roads/highways in North Tyneside in the year april 2018- april
2019 paid for out of our rates

2. please can you let me know how much was spent on footpaths in North Tyneside in the year april 2018- april 2019
paid for out of our rates

3 please can you let me know how much was spent on separate cycle paths in North Tyneside in the year april 2018- april
2019 paid for out of our rates

4. please can you let me know how much was spent on roads/highways in North Tyneside in the year april 2018- april
2019 paid for by other outside sources of funding

5 please can you let me know how much was spent on footpaths in North Tyneside in the year april 2018- april 2019 paid
for by other outside sources of funding

6 please can you let me know how much was spent on separate cycle paths in North Tyneside in the year april 2018- april
2019 paid for by other outside sources of funding

7 please can you tell me how much was spent on repairing maintaining foot bridges in n.tyneside april 2018-2019

Submitted on 10/10/19.

Response:
1 please can you let me know how much was spent on roads/highways in North Tyneside in the year april 2018- april
2019 paid for out of our rates

£1,285.084

2. please can you let me know how much was spent on footpaths in North Tyneside in the year april 2018- april 2019
paid for out of our rates

As above Q1

3 please can you let me know how much was spent on separate cycle paths in North Tyneside in the year april 2018- april
2019 paid for out of our rates

This information is not recorded separately from Highway maintenance

4. please can you let me know how much was spent on roads/highways in North Tyneside in the year april 2018- april
2019 paid for by other outside sources of funding

£11,477.908

5 please can you let me know how much was spent on footpaths in North Tyneside in the year april 2018- april 2019 paid
for by other outside sources of funding

As above Q4

6 please can you let me know how much was spent on separate cycle paths in North Tyneside in the year april 2018- april
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The information supplied to you is owned by the council unless otherwise stated and may be protected by copyright. You
are free to use it for your own purposes, including any non-commercial research or for the purposes of news reporting. Any
other re-use of a commercial nature will require the permission of North Tyneside Council. Further enquiries in this respect
should be directed to Information Governance Team, North Tyneside Council, Quadrant, The Silver Link North, Cobalt
Business Park, North Tyneside, NE27 0BY.



2019 paid for by other outside sources of funding

This information is not recorded separately from Highway maintenance

7 please can you tell me how much was spent on repairing maintaining foot bridges in n.tyneside april 2018-2019

This information is not recorded separately from Highway maintenance

FOI182020/11/19

The information supplied to you is owned by the council unless otherwise stated and may be protected by copyright. You
are free to use it for your own purposes, including any non-commercial research or for the purposes of news reporting. Any
other re-use of a commercial nature will require the permission of North Tyneside Council. Further enquiries in this respect
should be directed to Information Governance Team, North Tyneside Council, Quadrant, The Silver Link North, Cobalt
Business Park, North Tyneside, NE27 0BY.
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