Reference: FOI2730

North Tyt;eiide Council

Request:

I would be grateful if you could kindly confirm / provide the following information relating to
your bus shelter and stop contracts:

1.) Please confirm the contract start and end dates
2.) Please confirm the incumbent provider.

3.) Please also provide approximate number of bus shelters and bus stops covered in this
contract

Response

-Q1 and Q2

Bus shelters included within the Authority’s Bus Shelters contract_:

The contract start date is 6 Feb 1998 and the notional contract end date is 6 Feb 2023 if
the option to extend for a further 5-year period were not enacted by the Authority. The
incumbent contractor is ClearChannel UK Ltd.

Bus shelters and stops not included within the Authority’s Bus Shelters contract_:

Contracts relating to the cleaning and maintenance of these shelters are managed by
Nexus (Tyne and Wear Passenger Transport Executive). The Authority does not hold
current information on these contracts.

-Q3

Bus shelters included within the Authority’s Bus Shelters contract_:

The approximate number of bus shelters and bus stops covered in this contract is 192.
Bus shelters and stops not included within the Authority’s Bus Shelters contract :

The Authority does not hold current information on the numbers of bus shelters and bus
stops covered by contracts relating to the cleaning and maintenance of these shelters and
stops, which are managed by Nexus (Tyne and Wear Passenger Transport Executive).

The information supplied to you is owned by the council unless otherwise stated and may be protected by copyright. You are free to use
it for your own purposes, including any non-commercial research or for the purposes of news reporting. Any other re-use of a
commercial nature will require the permission of the Council. Further enquiries in this respect should be directed to Head of Law and
Governance, North Tyneside Council, Quadrant The Silver Link North, Cobalt Business Park, North Tyneside, NE27 0BY
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