



Reference: FOI2912

**Request:**

1.1 How many Looked After Children aged 16 and 17 does the council currently have?

**68 (34 aged 16; 34 aged 17)**

1.2 How many of these Looked After Children aged 16 and 17 does the council currently house in Semi Independent Accommodation?

**15**

1.3 Please provide the names of the companies who provide semi independent accommodation to your Looked After Children aged 16 and 17.

- **Starting Point/Elm House - in house provision**
- **DePaul**
- **Forever Care**
- **New Key**
- **Jigsaw**

1.4 Please provide the average cost per child per week per provider

We do not hold averages.

2.1 How many Care Leavers 18 plus does the council currently house in Semi Independent Accommodation?

- **Supported accommodation: 14**
- **Supported tenancies: 12**
- **Supported lodgings: 1**

2.2 Please provide the names of the companies who provide accommodation to your Care Leavers aged 18 plus

- **NEST (North East Supported Tenancies);**
- **New Key;**
- **DePaul UK;**
- **YMCA;**
- **Starting Point;**
- **Elm House;**
- **Maritime Court.**

2.3 Please provide the average cost per child per week per provider

**The Authority do not hold averages.**