Reference: FOI3201

Request: (responses in red)

| would like to know:

Morth Tyneside Council

1. The total number of trees felled by North Tyneside Council for the years 2020, 2019, 2018, 2017, 2016

(up to the most recent month of available data)

* For each year of data, please state and break down:

* The reason for the felling of said trees

* The cost to the council of felling trees

* The locations of trees felled

* The species of trees felled and in what capacity

* If trees felled were street trees or rural

Number of Trees removed:

2016 -17 102
2017 -18 80

2018 -19 116
2019 to date (October 2020) 447

e Trees were removed as per our tree policy being dead diseased or dangerous

e The specific cost of tree removal is not held. All works are within the wider budget set for

arboriculture

2. The total number of trees planted by North Tyneside Council for the years 2020, 2019, 2018, 2017,

2016 (up to the most recent month of available data)
* For each year of data, please state and break down:

* The cost to the council of planting trees
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Number of Trees planted:

Financial Year Trees planted Cost
2016 -17 207 £4998.00
2017 -18 188 £9114.00
2018 -19 248 £12.986.00
2019 to date (October 2020) 1115 £16.051.00
(2019-20 financial year)

* The locations of trees planted
2016 -2017

Whitley Bay — 9

St Marys — 24
Weetslade - 4
Monkseaton South — 12
Monkseaton North — 26
Longbenton — 24
Collingwood — 11
Killingworth — 11
Battlehill —3
Preston—2

Cullercoats -9

Valley — 2
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Benton - 24
Chirton —20
Wallsend — 11

Tynemouth — 19

2017 - 2018
Whitley Bay - 9
St Marys — 18

Weetslade - 7

Monkseaton South — 7

Monkseaton North — 13

Longbenton — 25
Collingwood — 2

Killingworth — 8

Battlehill - 3

Cullercoats — 5

2018 - 2019
Whitley Bay - 19

St Marys — 15

Monkseaton South — 37

Monkseaton North — 10

Longbenton — 26
Collingwood — 7

Battlehill — 1

Morth Tyneside Council
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Preston—1

Cullercoats — 47

Valley — 2
Benton -4
Chirton — 25

Tynemouth — 3
Valley -9

Howdon — 20

2019 -2020

Whitley Bay - 4

St Marys —13
Monkseaton North —10
Killingworth — 10
Preston—3

Cullercoats =51
Benton—10
Camperdown — 26

* The species of trees planted and in what capacity
2016 -2017

Acer campestra 12-14 cm 65L container. Acer platanoides 12-14cm 45L container. Alnus glutanosa 12-
14cm 45L container. Betula pendula 12-14cm 45L container.Betula utilis jacquemontii 12- 14cm 45L
container. Crataegus monogyna 10-12cm 45L container. Malus Coxs Orange pippin 08 — 10cm 45L
container. Magnolia Susan 08-10cm 65L container. Prunus nigra 2.5 — 3.0m 100L container. Quercus
petraea 12-14 45L container. Prunus avium 12-14cm 45L container. Sorbus aria 16-18cm 150L container.
Sorbus aria 12-14cm 65L container. Sorbus aucuparia 12-14cm 45L container. Sorbus aucuparia
“sheerwater seedling” 12 — 14cm 45L container. Sorbus intermedia 12-14cm 45L container Tilia cordata
12 -14cm 45L container
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2017 - 2018

Sorbus aucuparia “sheer water seedling” 12-14cm 45L container. Sorbus aria 12-14cm 45L container.
Sorbus intermedia 12-14cm 45L container. Sorbus torminalis 12-14cm 45L container. Laburnum waterii
Vossii 12-14cm 45L container. Acer campestra 12- 14cm 45L container. Betula utiles Jacquemonii 12-
14cm 45L container. Betula pendula tritis 12-14cm 45L container. Alnus glutanosa 12-14cm 45L
container. Prunus avium 12-14cm 45L container. Prunus avium Plena 12-14cm45L container. Prunus tai
haku 12-14cm 45L container. Prunus amanogowa 12-14cm 45L container Sequoiadendron giganteum
Wellingtonia 12-14cm 45L container. Taxus baccata Fastigita. Sorbus aria 12-14cm 45L container

2018 - 2019

Sorbus thuringiaca Fastigiata 12-14cm 45L container. Sorbus intermedia 12-14cm 45L container. Sorbus
aucuparia “sheer water seedling” 12-14cm 45L container. Sorbus aria 12-14cm 45L container. Acer
campestra 12-14cm 45L container. Betula pendula tristis 12-14cm 45L container. Alnus glutanosa 12-
14cm 45L container. Prunus avium 12-14cm 45L container. Prunus serrula tiretica 12-14cm 45L
container. Fagus sylvatica 12-14cm 65L container. Pyrus communis conference 10-12cm 35L container.
Acer buergeranum 20-25 cm 250 Itr container. Acer campestra Elegant 20-25cm 150Itr container. Sorbus
thuringiaca Fastigiata 20-25cm 150Iltr container.

2019 - 2020

Acer campestra 12-14cm 45L container. Alnus glutanosa 12-14cm 45L container. Betula pendula 12-
14cm 45L container Fagus sylvatica 12- 14cm 65L container. Magnolia Susan 12- 14cm 45L container.
Prunus avium 12-14cm 35L container. Quercus rubra 12-14cm 35L container. Sorbus aucuparia “sheer
water seedling” 12- 14cm 45 L container. Sorbus torminalis 10 — 12cm 35L container. Tilia cordata 12-
14cm 465L container

* |f trees planted were street trees or rural

Information not held — it would take longer than the appropriate timescales to consult all records for
individual trees to provide this detail.

3. The total number of trees under North Tyneside Council authority in the years 2020, 2019, 2018,

2017, 2016 (up to the most recent month of available data)
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Morth Tynesi&e Counell

Information not held specifically - The total number of trees is approximately 140,000 throughout
North Tyneside.

* For each year of data, please state and break down:
* The locations of trees

* The species of trees

* If trees were street trees or rural

If you cannot provide all of the data, please provide all that is available.



