

Reference: FOI4126

## Request:

1. The total number of lock-up domestic garages owned by the councils.

## 1694

2. The total number of these garages that are currently empty.

## 276

- 3. The total number that are currently let to council estate residents.
- 4. The total number that are let to non council estate residents.

For 3&4 - information not held - we do not hold an exact total for total number of garages let to Council or Non-Council tenants at any given point in time. The split is approximately 50/50.

5. The estimated average total space in sq ft of all the council-owned garages.

## information not held

The information supplied to you is owned by the council unless otherwise stated and may be protected by copyright. You are free to use it for your own purposes, including any non-commercial research or for the purposes of news reporting. Any other re-use of a commercial nature will require the permission of the Council. Further enquiries in this respect should be directed to Head of Law and Governance, North Tyneside Council, Quadrant The Silver Link North, Cobalt Business Park, North Tyneside, NE27 0BY

Date: 16/09/2021 Page 1 of 1