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Request: 
 

1. Please provide the latest available school forecasts for this education authority, 
showing the number of pupils in each year group at each school (or for their 
respective school planning areas if individual school forecasts are not available), 
these are likely to be the forecasts which were prepared by this education authority 
in the summer of 2021.  

Please see attached file 'FOI 4301 5 yrs projections'.  

This is based on the Jan 21 census update to the model and does not include 
the impact of housing 

2. Please provide the latest available Number on Roll (NOR) data from the Autumn 
2021 School Census when it becomes available, showing the number of pupils in 
each year group at each school. 
 
Information not held. The Autumn Census took place on Thursday 7 October, 
however, the data will not be available until December 2021. 

3. Please provide school places allocation data for 2020 and 2021 showing: 
(a) how many places were allocated each year at each school to out of 
catchment/out of area children (detailing from which other schools' catchment 
areas): 
 
Please see the Essential Guide To Schools on our website. NB: The figures 
recorded for siblings and distance will provide the out of catchment total. 
 
(b) how many places were allocated each year at each school to children living 
outside this education authority's area (indicating which area outside of this 
education authority's area they were living in when applying for a place). 
 
Information not held. Data is not recorded in a format that allows us to 
retrieve this information.  

In order to answer this question, we would need to manually check the 
individual records for every child at every school who was awarded a place 
under the distance or sibling criteria which would exceed the appropriate 
limit. 

 

 

https://my.northtyneside.gov.uk/category/220/essential-guide-schools
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4. Please provide copies of any feasibility studies undertaken since January 2020 to 

add capacity at any of these schools (whether this capacity has been added or not); 
please confirm how many school places these schools will have as a result and 
when these places will be available; and please confirm the capacity details of any 
new schools to be opened in this education authority's area within the next 5 years. 
 
None. The current Education Impact Assessment which forms part of the 
Local Plan assesses the likely future demand for School places across the 
Borough. This document is scheduled to be reviewed in 2022. 

 

 

https://my.northtyneside.gov.uk/sites/default/files/web-page-related-files/Education%20Infrastructure.pdf

