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Request: 
 
Under the Freedom of Information Act, could you provide the data for the below points, as 
of the 20th December 2022 (or the closest available date available in data):  
 
1. How many public buildings in your council had working smart energy meters installed 
on the premises? Please provide the data split by property type 

 
i. If available, please provide the date/year the smart energy meters were installed 

 
ii. If available, please provide any available data on when smart energy meters are 

planned to be installed on the premises which don't already have them 
 
Response:  
 

1.  

Office 12 

Community (including library) 11 

Sport & Leisure 16 

Bereavement 3 

 
i. This information is not held 
ii. This information is not held 

 
 
 


