

Reference: FOI-477

## Request:

I would be most grateful if you could provide the following information in respect of providers of exempt accommodation (regardless of whether they are registered as providers of social housing with the RSH) covering the period of the last 3 financial years (i.e. 2019-20, 2020-21, 2021-22):

- 1. Details of the lowest awarded eligible core rent;
- 2. Details of the highest awarded eligible core rent;
- 3. Details of the lowest awarded gross eligible rent (i.e. inclusive of the core rent and the eligible service charges);
- 4. Details of the highest awarded gross eligible rent (i.e. inclusive of the core rent and the eligible service charges); and
- 5. Details of any core rents and gross eligible rents where the claimed amount is higher than the highest awarded amounts AND has been subject to an appeal to the first-tier tribunal social entitlement chamber.

## Response:

- 1. This information is not available as we do not record the core rent, we record the gross rent and then deduct the ineligible service charges.
- 2. This information is not available as we do not record the core rent, we record the gross rent and then deduct the ineligible service charges.
- 2019-20 £125.34 per week
  2020-21 £ 78.28 per week
  2021-22 £79.51 per week
- 2019-20 £382.12 per week
  2020-21 £425.73 per week
  2021-22 £42148 per week
- 5. We have had no cases relating to this.

The information supplied to you is owned by the council unless otherwise stated and may be protected by copyright. You are free to use it for your own purposes, including any non-commercial research or for the purposes of news reporting. Any other re-use of a commercial nature will require the permission of the Council. Further enquiries in this respect should be directed to Head of Law and Governance, North Tyneside Council, Quadrant The Silver Link North, Cobalt Business Park, North Tyneside, NE27 0BY

Date: 14/02/2023 Page 1 of 1