Refere nce. FOI'561 North'l’yneslde Council

Request:

| would like to request the following information regarding adult care services. Please
kindly include responses on the attached Excel spreadsheet.

1. Please provide the average and median weekly rate paid by the LA in nursing and

residential care 2021/22 for:

Older person’s general placement

Older person’s EMI placement

Adult with a learning disability placement

Adult with a mental health need placement

Adult with a neurological need placement

Adult with a physical disability placement

Note: Please provide 2021/22 data as a snapshot at year end.
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2. Please provide the average and median weekly rate paid by the LA in nursing and

residential care 2022/23 for:

Older person’s general placement

Older person’s EMI placement

Adult with a learning disability placement
Adult with a mental health need placement
Adult with a neurological need placement
Adult with a physical disability placement
Note: Please provide 2022/23 data as a current snapshot. If not available, please
provide at YTD or budgeted year end.
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3. Please provide the budgeted average and median weekly rate paid by the LA in

nursing and residential care 2023/24 for:

Older person’s general placement

Older person’s EMI placement

Adult with a learning disability placement

Adult with a mental health need placement

Adult with a neurological need placement

Adult with a physical disability placement

Note: Please provide 2023/24 as an estimated or budgeted figure.
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4. Please provide the proposed average percentage uplift to the weekly rate paid by

the LA in nursing and residential between 2022/23 and 2023/24 for:
Older person’s general placement

Older person’s EMI placement

Adult with a learning disability placement

Adult with a mental health need placement

Adult with a neurological need placement

Adult with a physical disability placement
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The information supplied to you is owned by the council unless otherwise stated and may be protected by copyright. You are free to use

it for your own purposes, including any non-commercial research or for the purposes of news reporting. Any other re-use of a

commercial nature will require the permission of the Council. Further enquiries in this respect should be directed to Head of Law and

Governance, North Tyneside Council, Quadrant The Silver Link North, Cobalt Business Park, North Tyneside, NE27 0BY
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Note: Please provide the average proposed percentage uplift between 31 March
2023 and 1 April 2023

Response:

1. Information not held as the Authority does not hold data on averages.
However, under Section 16 Freedom of Information Act 2000, to provide advice
and assistance, the current and historic rates paid for commissioned services
can be found on the website here:
https://my.northtyneside.gov.uk/category/786/our-commissioning-intentions

2. As above
3. As above

4. Information not held as the rates for 2023/24 are yet to be determined as part of
the budget setting process.
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