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Reference: FOI-851 North Tyneside
Council

Request:

1. The total number of people currently on the waiting list for council
housing properties, broken down by bedroom number?

2. The number of people currently on the waiting list for housing in each
area of the council, broken down by property bedroom number?

3. The anticipated waiting time for council accommodation, broken down
by bedroom number.

4. The anticipated waiting time for council accommodation in each
geographical areq, broken down by bedroom property number.

5. The average waiting time for council accommodation, broken down by
bedroom number, in each of the last ten years.

6. The average waiting time for council accommodation in each
geographical areaq, broken down by bedroom number, in each of the last
ten years.

The information supplied to you is owned by the council unless otherwise stated and may be protected by copyright.
You are free to use it for your own purposes, including any non-commercial research or for the purposes of news
reporting. Any other re-use of a commercial nature will require the permission of the Council. Further enquiries in this
respect should be directed to Head of Law and Governance, North Tyneside Council, Quadrant The Silver Link North,
Cobalt Business Park, North Tyneside, NE27 OBY
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Reference: FOI-851

Response:

1.

Min bed
need

Max bed
need

No. of Applicants

1256

368

1
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322

2
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232

84
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2

13
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North Tyneside
Council
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Reference: FOI-851 North Tyneside
Council

2.

Min Max | NE12 | NE13 | NE23 | NE25 | NE26 | NE28 | NE29 | NE30 | NE7

bed bed

heed | heed

1 1 165 |24 47 51 50 305 |292 |66 9

1 2 48 |7 22 15 6 92 8l 27 2

1 3 1 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

2 2 91 1 31 27 24 182 150 45 4

2 3 49 5 13 9 3 92 81 15 3

2 4 0 0 0 0 0 ] ] 0 0

3 3 18 5 9 12 7 51 55 9 2

3 4 38 |1 8 9 4 62 59 7 3

3 5 14 1 3 2 3 18 28 3 0

3 6 0 0 0 0 0 0 ] 0 0

4 4 0 0 0 0 0 ] ] 0 0

4 5 0 0 0 ] ] 2 5 0 0

4 6 0 0 0 ] 0 ] 0 0 0

4 7 0 0 0 0 0 ] 0 0 0

3. Information not held. The Authority does not record anticipated waiting
times.

4. Information not held. The Authority does not record anticipated waiting
times.
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Reference: FOI-851 North Tyneside
Council
5.
Min Bed Max Bed
Need Need| 2016 2017| 2018 | 2019| 2020| 2021| 2022
1 1 361 295 283 235 280 288 358
1 2 456 414 289 327 280 366 452
] 3 144 59 100 349 n/a n/a 340
2 2 372 291 309 275 338 385 501
2 3 341 428 296 377 329 368 498
2 4 n/a 160 476 490 336 422 653
3 3 44] 518 396 518 398 400 557
3 4 349 412 365 356 395 484 539
3 5 566 383 421 450 357 353 576
4 4 n/a 80 595 n/a 301 0 1494
4 5 n/a 470 312 379 294 649 670
4 6 n/a 67 620 n/a 537 n/a n/a

Please note, under the provisions of the Data Protection Act 2016, personal
data is not kept for longer than necessary. Therefore, information is only
available from 2016 onwards.

6. Information not held. The Authority does not record average waiting time
in this level of detail.
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