Reference: FOI-902 North Tyneside
Council

Request:

1) How many parking PCNs in total were issued for the following years:

The following penalty charge notices for parking contraventions were issued by the
Civil Enforcement Officer on foot patrol and via the CCTV Enforcement Vehicle (the
numbers provided do not include penalty charge notices issued for bus lanes
contraventions using static CCTV cameras):

a) 1 January 2018- 31 December 2018 — 25,123
b) 1January 2019 - 31 December 2019 — 24,723
c) 1 January 2020 - 31 December 2020 - 19,131
d) 1January 2021 - 31 December 2021 - 24,598
e) 1January 2022 - 31 December 2022 - 26,606

2) How many parking PCNs were issued where the driver used a parking app for the
following years?

Information not held - The parking app is simply a payment option available to the
motorist to pay for their parking stay within North Tyneside. Motorists are issued with a
penalty charge notice in a charged parking location for parking without payment of
the parking charge - there is no way of determining if the motorist was utilising the

parking app.

a) 1January 2018- 31 December 2018
b) 1January 2019 - 31 December 2019
c) 1 January 2020 - 31 December 2020
d) 1 January 2021 - 31 December 2021
e) 1January 2022 - 31 December 2022

3) How many parking PCNs were issued by a civil enforcement officer for the following
years:
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The following penalty charge notices for parking contraventions were issued by the
Civil Enforcement Officer on foot patrol only.

a) 1January 2018- 31 December 2018 — 24,199
b) 1January 2019 - 31 December 2019 — 24,066
c) 1January 2020 - 31 December 202 — 18, 534
d) 1 January 2021 - 31 December 2021 — 23,953
e) 1January 2022 - 31 December 2022 - 25,754

4) Where a parking PCN was issued and the driver used a parking app, how many
parking PCNs were appealed for the following years:

Information not held - The parking app is simply a payment option available to the
motorist to pay for their parking stay within North Tyneside. Motorists are issued with a
penalty charge notice in a charged parking location for parking without payment of
the parking charge - there is no way of determining if the motorist was utilising the

parking app.

a) 1January 2018- 31 December 2018
b) 1January 2019 - 31 December 2019
c) 1 January 2020 - 31 December 202
d) 1 January 2021 - 31 December 2021
e) 1January 2022 - 31 December 2022

5) Where a parking PCN was issued and the driver used a parking app, how many
parking PCNs were appealed and then cancelled for the following years:

Information not held - The parking app is simply a payment option available to the
motorist to pay for their parking stay within North Tyneside. Motorists are issued with a
penalty charge notice in a charged parking location for parking without payment of
the parking charge - there is no way of determining if the motorist was utilising the

parking app.
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a) 1January 2018- 31 December 2018
b) 1January 2019 - 31 December 2019
c) 1January 2020 - 31 December 2020
d) 1January 2021 - 31 December 2021
e) 1 January 2022 - 31 December 2022

6) Where a parking PCN was issued by a civil enforcement officer, how many parking
PCNs were appealed and then cancelled for the following years?

This part of the request is refused under s12 (1) Freedom of Information Act 2000, since
the cost of complying would exceed the appropriate limit set out in the Freedom of
Information and Data Protection (Appropriate Limit and Fees) Regulations 2004.

In assessing the cost of complying, the costs attributable to officer time involved in
complying have been considered. Such costs are limited to £450.00 under the
Regulations, which equates to eighteen hours of officer time.

There is no report within the Notice Processing Software that will provide data on the
number of penalty charge notices that were closed following consideration of an
appeal. This information could only be obtained by checking the individual case folder
of each of the penalty charge notices. This level of analysis could not be undertaken in
the timeframe specified within the Freedom of Information legislation.

a) 1January 2018- 31 December 2018
b) 1January 2019 - 31 December 2019
c) 1 January 2020 - 31 December 2020
d) 1January 2021 - 31 December 2021
e) 1January 2022 - 31 December 2022
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