Reference: FOIO054 T

North Tyneside Council

Request:

1.In each of the last two financial years (16/17) and (17/18) how many Deferred Payment
Agreements have you agreed with people where their properties are taken as security for
people who need assistance with their care home fees.

16in 16/17. 4 in 17/18

2.For each year please state the value of the most expensive property that you have taken
as security against care home fees.

£270,000 16/17. £200,000 17/18

3.As at 31.3.18 what is the total value of care fees owed to the council that will eventually
be covered by the security of properties that you have taken into consideration as part of
the Deferred Payment Agreements.

Information not held

4.Under the Deferred Payment Agreements in place what is the total value of interest on
debts that has been charged to the accounts of people who have Deferred Payment
Agreements with your authority.

Information not held

The information supplied to you is owned by the council unless otherwise stated and may be protected by copyright. You are free to use
it for your own purposes, including any non-commercial research or for the purposes of news reporting. Any other re-use of a
commercial nature will require the permission of the Council. Further enquiries in this respect should be directed to Head of Law and
Governance, North Tyneside Council, Quadrant The Silver Link North, Cobalt Business Park, North Tyneside, NE27 0BY
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