Reference: FOI3416 No,.h',';i;e;,-;i;',,m"

Request:
I would like to request the following data:

a. how many Support Exempt Accommodation providers there are in your authority
area, for each of the past 3 calendar years.

**We do not hold a list of this information**

b. how many residents currently live in Support Exempt Accommodation, for each
of the past 3 calendar years.

**We do not hold a list of this information**

c. What is the total enhanced housing benefit paid to the Support Exempt
Accommodation sector in each of the past 3 calendar years.

**There is no enhanced Housing Benefit. All Housing Benefit is calculated using the same
legislation for income and expenditure. The information cannot be broken down into 3
calendar years **

d. How many claims have been approved for enhanced housing benefit for those
who live in Supported Enhanced Accommodation in each of the past 3 calendar
years.

**There is no enhanced Housing Benefit. All Housing Benefit is calculated using the same
legislation for income and expenditure. The information cannot be broken down into 3
calendar years **

The information supplied to you is owned by the council unless otherwise stated and may be protected by copyright. You are free to use
it for your own purposes, including any non-commercial research or for the purposes of news reporting. Any other re-use of a
commercial nature will require the permission of the Council. Further enquiries in this respect should be directed to Head of Law and
Governance, North Tyneside Council, Quadrant The Silver Link North, Cobalt Business Park, North Tyneside, NE27 0BY
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