

Reference: FOI3588

Request:

Please could you provide:

1a. The number of total deaths notified to the council amongst home care (domiciliary care) service users, by the day or month of notification (whichever is easier), between 01 April 2017 and 28 February 2021.

Please see attached 'FOI3588 Homecare Deaths'

1b. For the total number of deaths referenced in Question 1a, could you provide an age breakdown under the following categories: Under 18, 18-64, 65+.

under 18 = 0 18-64 = 40 65+ = 649

2a. The number of deaths notified to the council, involving Covid-19 amongst home care (domiciliary care) service users, by the day or month of notification (whichever is easier) since records began in 2020 until 28 February 2021.

This information is not held

2b. For the total number of deaths referenced in Question 2a, could you state how many people died as a result of confirmed Covid-19, suspected Covid-19, and did not die of Covid-19.

This information is not held

If possible, please also include the following:

3. The total number of people using local authority purchased domiciliary care services, for the tax years - 2017/18, 2018/19, 2019/20 and 2020/21 to date.

2017/18 = 1815 (this number includes extra care and it cannot be separated) 2018/19 = 1591

2019/20 = 1616 2020/21 = 1755 (this includes those receiving homecare under covid discharge arrangements)

All figures include clients who are self funding. They do not include CHC clients.

The information supplied to you is owned by the council unless otherwise stated and may be protected by copyright. You are free to use it for your own purposes, including any non-commercial research or for the purposes of news reporting. Any other re-use of a commercial nature will require the permission of the Council. Further enquiries in this respect should be directed to Head of Law and Governance, North Tyneside Council, Quadrant The Silver Link North, Cobalt Business Park, North Tyneside, NE27 0BY

Date: 21/04/2021 Page 1 of 2



Reference: FOI3588

4. The total number of local authority-purchased hours for domiciliary care services, for the tax years - 2017/18, 2018/19, 2019/20 and 2020/21 to date.

2017/18 = 649401 2018/19 = 528368 2019/20 = 521979 2020/21 = 545080

Please note 2017/18 includes extra care that cannot be separated out and therefore should not be used for comparison purposes

- 5. A list of your current home care (domiciliary care) providers.
- Adjuvo Ltd
- Allied Health Services
- Be caring
- Care Outcomes Ltd
- Castrian Group
- Comfort Call
- Copper Beech
- Dale Care
- Direct Health
- Everlasting Care
- Helping Hands
- HMS Care
- Homecare Plus
- Inspired Care
- JohnJasper Ass
- Life and Care sols / Right at home
- Life Choices / Everyday
- LS Care
- Mears
- My Homecare
- Niche Care
- Nurtured Care
- Pinnacle
- Routes
- Sevacare UK
- Springfield / Positive Life Choices
- St Anthony
- Unisus
- Voyage

The information supplied to you is owned by the council unless otherwise stated and may be protected by copyright. You are free to use it for your own purposes, including any non-commercial research or for the purposes of news reporting. Any other re-use of a commercial nature will require the permission of the Council. Further enquiries in this respect should be directed to Head of Law and Governance, North Tyneside Council, Quadrant The Silver Link North, Cobalt Business Park, North Tyneside, NE27 0BY

Date: 21/04/2021 Page 2 of 2