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Request: 

Please note that all questions relate to people with a disability in council funded care settings:  

1. How many people with a disability were placed in an accommodation based care setting 

(i.e. supported living, nursing/care home, NHS facility) in the council area over the course 

of 2016/17? 

 

912 

 

a. Please state the average (arithmetic mean) cost per placement.   

 

£619.13 

For the purpose of the FOI disability has been categorised as those clients with a 

support reason of Learning Disability, Physical Support or Visual Impairment. 

 

Average cost is based on all placements paid for Residential/Nursing or ISL to 

disabled clients (as categorised above) during 2016/17. 

 

2. How many people with a disability who were living at home, were placed ‘urgently’ in an 

accommodation based care setting over the course of 2016/17 with a notice period of: 

  

a. Between three and six months. 

b. Between one and 3 months. 

c. Between one week and one month. 

d. Less than one week. 

 

Information not held within the social care system based on period of notice. 

 

3. Please state the average (arithmetic mean) cost per placement to the council of placing a 

person with a disability in an accommodation based care setting in 2016/17 with a notice 

period of:  

  

a. More than six months.   

b. Between three and six months. 

c. Between one and three months. 

d. Between one week and one month. 

e. Less than one week. 

 

Information not held within the social care system based on period of notice. 

 


