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Request: 
 

I am writing to make an open government request for all the information to which I am entitled 
under the Freedom of Information Act 2000.  

Please send me: 

1. Statistics on the average change in annual income families with children in your local 
authority area have experienced as a result of the changes to welfare payments and 
benefit rules since 2010. 

We do not hold this information. 

2. Statistics on the average change in annual income disabled people living in your local 
authority area have experienced as a result of the changes to welfare payments and 
benefit rules since 2010. 

We do not hold this information. 

3.   The number of housing evictions that have taken place in your local area as a result of 
either the Benefit Cap and/or the Bedroom Tax.  

 We are unable to show that a person has been evicted specifically due to bedroom tax or 
benefit caps. 

3. Statistics on the number of people in your local authority who have had a social care 
assessment and are now being supported by a paid care worker.   

We do not hold this information. 

 

 

 
 


